

County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House
195 Arsenal Street
Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077
Fax: 315-785-7591



Email Addresses:

marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us
amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Buyers
Karin Dorr
Amanda McCracken

Director
Mark Sachetti
NIGP-CPP, CPPB

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore
Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD

December 27, 2021

ATTN REBECCA MILLER
BOB BARKER COMPANY INC
7925 PURFOY ROAD
FAQUARY-VARINA NC 27526

BID # 21-12a NAME INMATE APPAREL & SUPPLIES - AWARD AS PER HIGHLIGHTED TABULATION

CONTRACT PERIOD: DATE OF AWARD THROUGH June 30, 2024

Dear Ms. Miller:

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are enclosed or pending:

✓ Purchase Order to be issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director

C: Department, Auditor, Bid File, Charm-Tex, Corcraft

County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House
195 Arsenal Street
Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077
Fax: 315-785-7591



Email Addresses:

marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us
amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Buyers
Karin Dorr
Amanda McCracken

Director
Mark Sachetti
NIGP-CPP, CPPB

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore
Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD

December 27, 2021

ATTN STAN DANZGER
CHARM-TEX
1618 CONEY ISLAND AVE
BROOKLYN NY 11230

BID # 21-12a NAME INMATE APPAREL & SUPPLIES - AWARD AS PER HIGHLIGHTED TABULATION

CONTRACT PERIOD: DATE OF AWARD THROUGH June 30, 2024

Dear Mr. Danzger:

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are enclosed or pending:

✓ Purchase Order to be issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director

C: Department, Auditor, Bid File, Bob Barker, Corcraft

BID #21-12a
INMATE APPAREL AND SUPPLIES
BID TABULATION
DATE OF AWARD - 6/30/24

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	PER PKG.	Date of Award - 6/30/2022					7/1/2022 - 6/30/2023					7/1/2023 - 6/30/2024					
			ESTIMATED ANNUAL QTY	MINIMUM ORDER QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE PER PKG.	EXTENDED PRICE	PRODUCT CODE	MINIMUM ORDER QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE PER PKG.	EXTENDED PRICE	PRODUCT CODE	MINIMUM ORDER QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE PER PKG.	EXTENDED PRICE	PRODUCT CODE			
APPAREL ITEMS																		
1	SOCKS, One Size Fits All Ankle/Crew, 80% Cotton, 20% Man Made Fiber, Color: White	DOZ	100 DOZEN															
	BOB BARKER			N/A	\$5.45	\$545.00	2700-W	N/A	\$5.61	\$561.00	2700-W	N/A	\$5.78	\$578.00	2700-W			
	CHARM-TEX		50 dozen		\$5.88	\$588.00	SCK/CREW	50 dozen	\$5.88	\$0.00	SCK/CREW	50 dozen	\$5.88	\$0.00	SCK/CREW			
	CORCRAFT				NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID				
	NYSC				NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID				
2	SWEATSHIRTS, Hooded Size: 3XL- 8 XL Hood is 1-Ply Material w/ NO Drawstrings, Cuffs and Waistbands to be cover seamed and ribbed, Heavy Weight Material, 50% Cotton/50% Polyester, JCCF to be imprinted in 3" Black Letters on Back Color: Gray	EA	20 EACH															
	BOB BARKER				3XL	NO BID	NO BID		3XL	NO BID	NO BID		3XL	NO BID	NO BID			
					5XL-6XL	NO BID	NO BID		5XL-6XL	NO BID	NO BID		5XL-6XL	NO BID	NO BID			
					7XL - 8XL	NO BID	NO BID		7XL - 8XL	NO BID	NO BID		7XL - 8XL	NO BID	NO BID			
	CHARM-TEX				3XL	NO BID	NO BID		3XL	NO BID	NO BID		3XL	NO BID	NO BID			
					5XL-6XL	NO BID	NO BID		5XL-6XL	NO BID	NO BID		5XL-6XL	NO BID	NO BID			
					7XL - 8XL	NO BID	NO BID		7XL - 8XL	NO BID	NO BID		7XL - 8XL	NO BID	NO BID			
	CORCRAFT					NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID			
	NYSC					NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID			
3	SWEATSHIRTS, #SSGY - Gray, Crewneck pullover, no pocket	EA	135 EACH															
	BOB BARKER				Size: 7XL	NO BID	NO BID		Size: 7XL	NO BID	NO BID		Size: 7XL	NO BID	NO BID			
	CHARM-TEX				Size: 7XL	NO BID	NO BID		Size: 7XL	NO BID	NO BID		Size: 7XL	NO BID	NO BID			
	CORCRAFT				Size: 7XL	NO BID	NO BID		Size: 7XL	NO BID	NO BID		Size: 7XL	NO BID	NO BID			
	NYSC					NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID			
4	COATS, WORK - Durable, Heavy Weight Fabric, 100% Polyester shrink-resistant, Blanket Linings, Orange	EA	60 (TOTAL DIFFERENT SIZES)															
	BOB BARKER			N/A	Size: 38-40	\$17.00	\$340.00	652-OR-3840	N/A	Size: 38-40	\$17.51	\$350.20	652-OR-3840	N/A	Size: 38-40	\$18.02	\$360.40	652-OR-3840
				N/A	Size: 42-44	\$17.00	\$340.00	652-OR-4244	N/A	Size: 42-44	\$17.51	\$350.20	652-OR-4244	N/A	Size: 42-44	\$18.02	\$360.40	652-OR-4244
				N/A	Size: 46-48	\$17.00	\$340.00	652-OR-4648	N/A	Size: 46-48	\$17.51	\$350.20	652-OR-4648	N/A	Size: 46-48	\$18.02	\$360.40	652-OR-4648
	CHARM-TEX				Size: 38-40	\$18.54	\$1,112.40		Size: 38-40	\$18.54	\$1,112.40		Size: 38-40	\$18.54	\$1,112.40			
					Size: 42-44	\$18.90	\$1,134.00		Size: 42-44	\$18.90	\$1,134.00		Size: 42-44	\$18.90	\$1,134.00			
					Size: 46-48	\$19.90	\$1,194.00		Size: 46-48	\$19.90	\$1,194.00		Size: 46-48	\$19.90	\$1,194.00			
	CORCRAFT					NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID			
	NYSC					NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID			
5	CAPS, BEANIE - Warm, high-bulk 100% Acrylic Knit, Suitable for Embroidery, Machine Wash, No Lip, One Size Fits All	12/CS	15 CASES															
	BOB BARKER					NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID			
	CHARM-TEX					\$14.18	\$212.70			\$14.18	\$212.70			\$14.18	\$212.70			
	CORCRAFT					NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID			
	NYSC					NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID			

BID #21-12a
 INMATE APPAREL AND SUPPLIES
 BID TABULATION
 DATE OF AWARD - 6/30/24

ITEM #	DESCRIPTION	PER PKG.	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QTY	Date of Award - 6/30/2022				7/1/2022 - 6/30/2023				7/1/2023 - 6/30/2024				
				MINIMUM ORDER QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE PER PKG.	EXTENDED PRICE	PRODUCT CODE	MINIMUM ORDER QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE PER PKG.	EXTENDED PRICE	PRODUCT CODE	MINIMUM ORDER QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE PER PKG.	EXTENDED PRICE	PRODUCT CODE	
	TOTAL FOR BOB BARKER APPAREL					\$1,565.00					\$1,611.60				\$1,659.20	
	TOTAL FOR CHARM TEX APPAREL					\$4,241.10					\$4,241.10				\$4,241.10	
	INMATE SUPPLIES															
6	SOAP, Bar, Unwrapped, .5 oz.	1,000/CASE	9 CASES													
	BOB BARKER			N/A	\$57.00	\$513.00	U1-C	N/A	\$58.71	\$528.39	U1-C	N/A	\$60.42	\$543.78	U1-C	
	CHARM-TEX				\$46.90	\$422.10			\$46.90	\$422.10			\$46.90	\$422.10		
	CORCRAFT				NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID		
	NYSC				NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID		
7	SOAP, Bar, Unwrapped, 1.5 oz.	500/CASE	2 CASES													
	BOB BARKER			N/A	\$74.00	\$148.00	TU15-C	N/A	\$76.22	\$152.44	TU15-C	N/A	\$78.44	\$156.88	TU15-C	
	CHARM-TEX				\$54.90	\$109.80			\$54.90	\$109.80			\$54.90	\$109.80		
	CORCRAFT				NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID		
	NYSC				NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID		
8	RAZORS, Disposable, Single Blade, Stainless Steel w/Clear, Removable Safety Cap	100/CASE	4 CASES													
	BOB BARKER			N/A	600/CASE	\$35.18	R600	N/A	600/CASE	\$36.24	R600	N/A	600/CASE	\$37.29	R600	
	CHARM-TEX					\$8.90				\$8.90				\$8.90		
	CORCRAFT					NO BID				NO BID				NO BID		
	NYSC					NO BID				NO BID				NO BID		
9	SHAMPOO, All-one	GAL	3 GALLON													
	BOB BARKER					NO BID				NO BID				NO BID		
	CHARM-TEX					\$54.90				\$54.90				\$54.90		
	CORCRAFT					NO BID				NO BID				NO BID		
	NYSC					NO BID				NO BID				NO BID		
10	PUMP, Gallon for above	EA	1 EA													
	BOB BARKER					NO BID				NO BID				NO BID		
	CHARM-TEX					\$6.90				\$6.90				\$6.90		
	CORCRAFT					NO BID				NO BID				NO BID		
	NYSC					NO BID				NO BID				NO BID		
11	SHOWER CURTAIN, 36" X 82". Velcro Loops, Weighted, Clear View Top	EA	15 EACH													
	BOB BARKER					NO BID				NO BID				NO BID		
	CHARM-TEX					NO BID				NO BID				NO BID		
	CORCRAFT					NO BID				NO BID				NO BID		
	NYSC					NO BID				NO BID				NO BID		
12	PILLOW CASES, White, Poly Cotton Blend, Fits Standard size 20" x 26"	DOZ	50 DOZEN													
	BOB BARKER			N/A	\$8.83	\$441.50	PC4234	N/A	\$9.09	\$454.50	PC4234	N/A	\$9.36	\$468.00	PC4234	
	CHARM-TEX				\$8.90	\$445.00	4234W130		\$8.90	\$445.00			\$8.90	\$445.00		
	CORCRAFT - *RECEIVED WAIVER				\$30.00	\$1,500.00			\$30.00	\$1,500.00			\$30.00	\$1,500.00		
	NYSC				NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID		
13	BLANKETS, Fire Resistant, 4#, 90% Woven Wool, 66" x 90"	EA	72 EACH													
	BOB BARKER			N/A	\$10.25	\$738.00	WB6690G4	N/A	\$10.56	\$760.32	WB6690G4		\$10.87	\$782.64	WB6690G4	
	CHARM-TEX				\$9.90	\$712.80	POMONA90		\$9.90	\$712.80			\$9.90	\$712.80		
	CORCRAFT				NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID		
	NYSC				NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID		
14	MATTRESS COVER, Vinyl, Flame Resistant, 30"x75"x4", Dark Green	EA	5 EACH													
	BOB BARKER			N/A	\$15.00	\$75.00	VMC30724	N/A	\$15.45	\$77.25	VMC30724	N/A	\$15.90	\$79.50	VMC30724	
	CHARM-TEX				\$20.90	\$104.50	MC30754VINYL		\$20.90	\$104.50			\$20.90	\$104.50		
	CORCRAFT				NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID		
	NYSC				NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID		
	TOTAL FOR BOB BARKER SUPPLIES					\$1,950.68				\$2,009.14				\$2,068.09		
	TOTAL FOR CHARM TEX SUPPLIES					\$2,001.40				\$2,001.40				\$2,001.40		
	GRAND TOTAL BOB BARKER					\$3,515.68				\$3,620.74				\$3,727.29		

